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BACKGROUND 
 
Fibroblast growth factors (FGFs) and their 
receptors constitute an elaborate signaling system 
that participates in many developmental and repair 
processes of virtually all mammalian tissues. 
Among the 23 FGF members, ten have been 
identified in the brain. Four FGF receptor tyrosine 
kinases (FGFR1-4) are known so far.1 Ligand 
binding of these receptors greatly depends on the 
presence of heparan sulfate proteoglycans, which 
act as low affinity FGFRs. Ligand binding specificity 
of FGFRs depends on the third extracellular Ig-like 
domain, which is subject to alternative splicing. 
The FGF elicits the regulatory activity by binding to 
FGF receptor (FGFR)-heparin sulfate complexes 
and inducing receptor auto-phosphorylation, as 
well as phosphorylation of downstream signaling 
molecules. These include phosphorylation of Src 
and PLC-gamma, leading finally to activation of 
PKC, Crk and Shc.  
  
SNT/FRS2 serves as an alternative link between 
FGFRs to the activation of PKC, and additionally 
activates the Ras signaling cascade.2 Deregulation 
of FGFR signaling, by activating mutations or 
ligand/receptor overexpression, could allow these 
receptors to become constitutively active, leading 
to cancer development. These cancers include 
hematopoietic and solid tumors (breast, bladder, 
and prostate carcinomas). 
 
The fgfr-4 gene is located on chromosome 13 in 
mice and 5q33-qter in humans, and is unusual in 
that it does not undergo the alternative splicing 
described for the other receptors. FGFR-4 binds 
strongly to acidic FGF, basic FGF and FGF-4, FGF-
6, FGF-8, FGF-9, FGF15, and FGF19 and it also 
binds FGF-3 and FGF-5 with less affinity. FGFR-4 
associates with an 85 kDa serine kinase, which it 
can activate in a process that is dependent on 
ligand binding but independent of receptor 
tyrosine phosphorylation. FGFR4 plays an 
important role in development. During mouse 
embryonic development, FGFR4 expression was 
found early in the endodermal compartments of 
the gut and yolk sac and in the myotomal 
compartment of the somites, then  in the 
developing skeletal muscles, a number of 
endodermally derived tissues including liver, lung 
and pancreas, and the adrenal cortex and kidney. 
FGFR4 is also found in the ventricular zone and 
cortex of the murine brain. FGFR4 expression has 
also been seen in a number of mammary 
carcinomas, suggesting an involvement in breast 
cancer.3  On the other hand, FGFR4 was shown to 
be involved in regulation of metabolism. FGFR4 
may a primary target of insulin regulation in 
hepatocytes. Both insulin and FGF activate the PI 
3-kinase pathway and FoxO1 is a key node in the 
convergence of FGF and insulin signaling pathways 
and functions as a key integrator for the regulation 
of glucose and bile acid metabolism.4 
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TECHNICAL INFORMATION 
 
Source: 
FGFR4 Antibody is a mouse monoclonal antibody 
raised against purified recombinant human FGFR4 
fragments expressed in E. coli. 
 
Specificity and Sensitivity: 
This antibody detects FGFR4 proteins without 
cross-reactivity with other family members. 
 
Storage Buffer: PBS and 30% glycerol  
 
Storage: 
Store at -20°C for at least one year. Store at 4°C 
for frequent use. Avoid repeated freeze-thaw 
cycles. 
 
 
APPLICATIONS 
 

Application: *Dilution: 
WB 1:1000 
IP n/d 

IHC 1:200 
ICC n/d 

FACS n/d 
*Optimal dilutions must be determined by end user. 
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QUALITY CONTROL DATA 

 
 
Top: Western Blot detection of FGFR4 proteins in 
bacterial lysate containing His-tagged-hFGFR4 
fragment fusion (28 kDa) proteins using FGFR4 
Antibody. Bottom: This antibody stains paraffin-
embedded human hepatoma tissue in 
immunohistochemical analysis. 


